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Subject: RE: Your client
* Date: 2/9/2018 2:47:10 PM Eastern Stapdard Time

From: tkirtner@gsish.com
To: dpend440@aol.com

Sorry the previous email was overlooked. | can’t say the precise status without looking at some older records. The
attorney who handled this initially is deceased. | will try to get back to you next week.

From: Dianna Pendleton [mailto:dpend440@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, February 09, 2018 2:45 PM

To: Tim Kirtner <tkirtner@gsish.com>

Subject: Fwd: Your client

The Claimants' Advisory Committee sent you an email dated January 26, 2018 regarding urgent issues for one of your
clients in the Dow Corning Settlement Program. We asked that you respond to acknowledge receipt of the email and to
avoid the Finance Committee pursuing an Order to Show Cause against your law firm. We have not heard from you.
Please respond to our email (see below) or the Finance Committee will take action.

Sincerely,
Dianna Pendleton-Dominguez
Claimants' Advisory Committee

From: dpend440@aol.com

To: IKirtner@agsish.com

Cc: ehomsby@iphw-law.com

Sent: 1/26/2018 11:36:56 AM Eastern Standard Time
Subject: Your client

s

Dear Mr. Kirtner,

Ernie Hornsby and | are writing as members of the Claimants' Advisory Committee in the Dow
Corning bankruptcy settlement regarding your breast implant client in the Settlement Facility -
Dow Corning Trust (SF-DCT). Your client's name is (SID 0951227).

(See attached document) We are sending this email to you because questions have arisen
about two payments to and the Settlement Facility has asked us to assist them.
The Settlement Facility sent a Rupture Premium Payment of $2,500 to you on 10/14/2014 and
a Disease Premium Payment of $2,000 on 10/14/2014. The Settlement Facility sent a copy of
the award letters to “however, the letters were returned as undeliverable,
suggesting that the claimant had moved.

Ellen Bearicks of the SF-DCT informs us that she has requested that you provide her with the
updated address for but you have not done so. We are writing because under the
Settlement Plan, Article X, "all funds in the Settlement Facility are in the custody of the Court
until the funds have actually been paid to and received by the Claimant (or a legally authorized
recipient.)" This means that if you received the claimant payments and deposited them into
your law firm's IOLTA / trust account but the payments were not distributed to the claimant or
her heirs within 180 days, then the entire claimant payment must be returned to the SF-DCT.
The funds cannot remain in your law firm's trust account indefinitely. Please provide
documentation to the Settlement Facility with the updated address for and
affirmation that the funds were distributed to her. The Finance Committee is about to seek an
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Order to Show Cause against you and your law firm to have the funds retuned to them unless
an updated address for 1is provided to them immediately. We asked them to
temporarily defer doing this so that we could have an opportunity to intervene and see if this
matter could be resolved.

Please respond to acknowledge receipt of this email and/or contact Ellen Bearicks directly so
that this matter can be resolved before an Order to Show Cause is filed.

Sincerely,

Dianna Pendleton-Dominguez, Esq.

Claimants' Advisory Committee

Dow Corning Bankruptcy Settlement

P.O. Box 665

St. Marys, OH 45885

419-394-0717



